
From: Ann Rodriquez 
Sent: Thursday, December 29, 2016 6:33 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: TSG Invoice for Service Rendered 

sorry, will do 

Ann R. 

On Dec 29, 2016, at 2:24 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacati=n@gmail.com> wrote: 

dont send me invoices please s=nd to rich . 

On Thu, Dec 29, 2016 at 2:22 PM, Ann Rodriquez 
> wrote: 

Ann R. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Bob Petersen 
Dat=: December 29, 2016 at 1:52:03 PM AST 
To: ann rodriquez 

Ann and Brice, 

Please see attached invoice for service rendered at t=e RO plant in October and December. The 
calibration solutions were requeste= by Smiley. 

We are working today on a quote for the two re=uested Profibus repeaters and membranes, 
etc. We will not include lab=r on the quote as it is difficult to estimate site time in advance.<=> 
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The cost for the Danfoss conversion will be provided s=parately as it will require some 
engineering time and our Florida office ha= many people out for the holidays. 

Best regards, 

Bob Petersen=/span> 

General Manager=/span> 
TSG Water Resources, USVI Inc. 
6501 Red Hook Plaza, 
Suite 201 
St. Thomas, US Virgin Islands 00802 

<http://www.tsgwater.com> 
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=nbsp; please note 

The information contained=in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged= may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use o= the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosur= or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohib=ted 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in e=ror, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com<=a>, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including a=l attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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