
From: Joana Vicente <, 
Sent: Tuesday, December 27, 2016 5:50 PM 
To: Peggy Siegal 
Cc: Jeffrey E.; IFP Business Office 
Subject: Re: movies 

Hi Jeffrey 
Sorry for the misunderstanding. We appreciat= your generosity and I hope to have you as my guest at the Gotham 
Awards n=xt year. 
Thanks again for supporting the organization= and the work we do helping and connecting hundreds of storytellers e=ch 
year with the resources they need to get their stories told. 
Best wishes for the New Year! 
Joana 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 27, 2016, at 12:05 PM, Peggy Siegal > wrote:

OK. I am sure it was just a mistake because I told joana Vicen=e, their president and my good friend...that you 
were giving $10,000 not $=0,000....so their have to decide to take the payment for last or this year=..both. 

They will figure it out. Sorry for the confusion. 
xoxo peggy 

From: jeffrey E. 
Sent: Tuesday, December 27, 2016 4:51 PM 
To: Peggy Siegal 
Subject: movies 

they credited the 10 k i sent last month=nbsp; to last year without asking 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
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communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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