From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, January 11, 2017 8:30 PM
To: Richard Kahn
Subject: Fwd: Meed your help

--=------- Forwarded messag= ----------

From: Lamster, Ira B. sk e —
Date: Tue, lan 10, 2017 at 3:07 PM

Subject: R=: Need your help
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeeva=ation@gmail.com> >

Hi,<=p>

Latest development, as we=are working on the issue of transfer right now...it appears that Col=mbia will NOT release
any remaining funds in the gift account, because as you recall the check was written to Columbia University. =hat was

required so that the contribution could be considered by you as a =haritable contribution.

| am sorry to bother you =ith all this, but this outcome does not surprise me, This is just not righ=, since the money was

donated for my work. However, universities never like to part with funds.

Ira <=span>

Ira B. Lamster D.D.5., M.M.5c <http://M.M.5c> .<=p>
Professor, Department of =ealth Policy & Management
Mailman School of Public =ealth

Dean Emeritus</=>

College of Dental Medicin=

Columbia University

722 West 168th Street<=u>

4th Floor, Room 487

New York, NY 10032=u>
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From: Lamster,=lra B.

Sent: Tuesday, January 10, 2017 2:37 PM
To: 'jeffrey E.'

Subject: RE: Need your help

Thanks for replying quick=y... as to the remaining amount, right now it will be about $11K. Ho=ever, since Columbia may
allow this account to be transferred to Stony Brook, | am trying to shift some expenses from this gift account to =nother

account that | now control but that Columbia will not release, so |=may be more.

Ira<=p=>

Ira B. Lamster D.D.5., M.M.Sc <http://M.M.5c> .<=p>
Professor, Department of =ealth Policy & Management
Mailman School of Public =ealth

Dean Emeritus</=>

College of Dental Medicin=

Columbia University

722 West 168th Street<=u>

4th Floor, Room 487

New York, NY 10032=u>

From: jeffrey =. [mailto:jeeva=ation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com= |
Sent: Tuesday, January 10, 2017 2:02 PM

To: Lamster, Ira B.

Subject: Re: Need your help

of course how much is still left. ? =AQ i might be willing to donate more

wrote:
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Hi Jeff,
It has been some time since we last spoke and hope a=| is well with you,

Since leaving the dental school, | have been at the =ailman School of Public Health, which has been a terrific
experience.</=>

As you recall, you were kind enough to provide me wi=h an unrestricted gift when | began my work at the School of
Public Health= This support was invaluable, and contributed to advancing discussion about the future of the dental
profession, and the im=ortance of oral findings in persons with diabetes mellitus. This resulted =n the publication of 1
book, 2 monographs, 2 other book chapters and=numerous papers in refereed journals.

After 28 years, however, | have decided to leave Col=mbia and explore some other opportunities. | will be taking a part-
time fa=ulty appointment at the Stony Brook University School of Dental Medicine, with a focus on developing their
global oral health pr=gram.

Here is my request: some of the money you provided w=Il remain in my gift account at the end of June, when | will be
leaving Co=umbia. | would like to move those funds to Stony Brook to support my work there, but need the permission
of the donor, mean=ng you. If those funds are not moved, they will revert to Columbia.=u>

Please let me know if you agree to this request</=>

Thanks, and look forward to hearing from you.=u>

Ira

Ira B. Lamster D.D.5., M.M.5c <http://M.M.5c> .
Professor, Department of Health Policy & Managem=nt
Mailman School of Public Health

Dean Emeritus

College of Dental Medicine

Columbia University

722 West 168th Street

4th Floor, Room 487

New York, NY 10032
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please no=e

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use,
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com>, and destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

=AD please note

The information contained in this commus=ication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may cons=itute
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addre=see. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use,
disclosure or copyi=g of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited a=d may be unlawful. If you have
received this communication in error, pl=ase notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com, a=d destroy this communication and all copies thereof, including all a=tachments. copyright -all
rights reserved
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