
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, December 27, 2016 1:25 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Overdue Invoice 

tel peggy. but send additional 

On Tue, De= 27, 2016 at 8:24 AM, Richard Kah wrote: 

they are impossible - we sent check last year and they never cash=d so we voided 

they cashed current year check and appli=d to 2015 so now they are saying 2016 is open.. 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
N=w York, NY 10022 

On Dec 27, 2016, at 8:21 AM, Lesley=Groff 
wrote: 

Begin forwarded message: 

<=>From: Peggy Siegal mimpippogiummmumpipplignima> > 
=div style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-left=0px">Subject: Re: 

Overdue Inv=ice 

Date: December 27, 2016 at 12:40:42 AM EST 
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Lesley...this is for the ballroom chairs rental Jeffrey =ives every year to the Gotham Awards/IFC. 
Independent Film Awards on the M=nday after Thanksgiving. 

When everyone is back from vacation, can you plea=e look into this. 
Thanks so much. =A0 
Peggy Siegal 
= = 

= = = 
= = 

<=d colspan="2" style="font-size:initial;text-align:initial;background-c=lorrgb(265,255,255)"> 
From: 
Sent: </=>Monday, December 26, 2016 10:30 PM 
To: peggy@peggysiegal.com 
Subject: Overdue Invoice 

chttps://invoice.ifp.org/img/login-logo.png> 

<=td> 
Overdue Invoice 

Dea= Jeffrey Epstein 

You may have missed the attached invoice (which has=since become overdue). 

May you please forward this email to your Pay=bles Department and advise when we might expect payment? 

We accept p=yment by Check or Wire Transfer (details in the attachment), or credit car= (details in the hyperlink below). 

• Jeffrey Epstein 
• Invoice Number: 185 
• Invoice Date: November 23, 2016 
• Amount Due: $10,000.00 
• Date Due: December 23, 2016 
• View & Pay Invo=ce Now 
<http://mandrillapp.com/track/click/30561300/invoice.ifp.org=p=eyJzIjoiNVAlOGhReHZCMXFWZU1GS1BTR0VJWGSZN 
31Nliwidil6MSwicCI6IntcInVcIj=zMDU2MTMwMCxclnZcljoxtfwidX.IsXCI6XCJodHRwczpcXFwvXFxcllludm9pY2UuaWZwL 
m9yZ=xcXC9pbnZvaWNIXFxcL3ZpZXdcXFwvMTQ2OVxcXC9clixclmIkXCI6XCI5MmNhZmViNWJhZDM0=zgxYmZjZmYwYWY 
3YzVIMTBjZIwiLFwidXJsX2Ikc1wiOltcljI4NzAzZDMzNTZkZjFiNjQzMzI=M2Y4NjM5YmNmMzQyNzVkZmQ2YWVcII19In0> 

Thank You, 

IFP Business Office 
2=2.465-8200 x201 <tel:(212)%20465-8200> businessoffice@=fp.org <mailto:businessoffice@ifp.org> 

IFP I 30 John St I =AO Brooklyn, NY 11201 I Tel: (212) 465-8200</=> <tel:=212)%20465-8200> 
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<http://mandrillapp.com/track/open.php?u=30561300&id=92c=feb5bad34c8lbfcff0af7c5e10d> 

=C2 please note 

The information containe= in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileg=d, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the u=e of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disc=osure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly =rohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communicati=n in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail =o jeevacation@g=ail.com <mailtojeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
=ncluding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

</=iv> 
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