
From: Brice Gordon < 
Sent: Friday, December 23, 2016 2:37 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: 

Jef=rey 

=div class="gmail_default" style="font-size:small">can we draw 20k of t=e 50k this year, the remaining balance next 
year, at some point of time 

regards Brice 

On Thu, Dec 15, 201= at 9:06 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacatio=@gmail.com» wrote:<=r> 

whether brice decides to=go or not please pay them the 50 k in reimbursables , wh=n they choose - brice -
talk over the weekend , I leeave tomor= from new york so swamped . but have time after . 

=div> 

=C24) please note 

The information contained in this communic=tion is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constit=te inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addresse=. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying =f this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and =ay be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, pleas= notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and<=r>destroy this communication and all copies 

thereof, 
including all atta=hments. copyright -all rights reserved 

Brice Gordon 
Stanley, NM 

Ph: 
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