
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, December 16, 2016 2:14 PM 
To: Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: 

is there any other related. like expenses =for me etc 

On Fri, Dec 16, 2016 at 9:00 AM, Bella Klein &I.;bklein575@gmail..om <mailto:bklein575@gmail.com» wrote: 

Jeffrey, 
Attached please find Amex charges for for the period November 1st = December 16th. Double charge 

from Equinox on November 23rd is one f=r and second fori l. Please let me know if i answer=d your 
question and you need more information. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

=AO please note 

The information conta=ned in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privi=eged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for th= use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
d=sclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strict=y prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communic=tion in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-ma=l to 
jeevacatio=@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies 
thereof,<=r>including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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