
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Sunday, December 18, 2016 8:13 PM 
To: brice gordon 
Subject: Re: LS1 PRD Refit 

ok 

On Sun, Dec 18, 2016 at 1:16 PM, brice gordon bgordon.lsj=gmail.com <mailto: > wrote: 

Jeffrey 

attached for yo=r review, estimates for the refinishing of PRD Hull and Topside 
=hoto's showing present condition of PRD and Cushions 
Carlos =ecommends Kenny's Yacht Maintenance performs the work on LSJ- see atta=hed E mail 
Carlos is having issue getting replacement fittings f=r Cape Horn, i would estimate the following 

Hull =nd Topside $7870.00 
Cushions and covers $3000.00 
Fitti=gs $1000.00 
Stereo and Speakers $1000.00 

Estimated Total $12,7870.00 

Please note cu=hions are already been removed delivered for repair 
Do we have y=ur approval to proceed with the remaining work. 

<=iv class="m_-2403303873359847513m6575527272582866805m_-6839228300260441=44gmail_signature" 
data-smartmail="gmail_signature"> 

=AO please note 

The information contained i= this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged,=may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use =f the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclos=re or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly pro=ibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication =n error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to =a 

EFTA_R1_01918394 
EFTA02666845



href="mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com" target="_blank">jeevacation@gmai=.com, and destroy this communication and 
all copies thereof, inc=uding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

2 

EFTA_R1_01918395 
EFTA02666846


