
From: 
Sent: Sunday, December 18, 2016 9:33 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: LS1 PRD Refit 

thank you 

On Sun, Dec 18, 2016 at 4:12 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacat=on@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» wrote: 

ok 

Cr> 

On Sun, Dec 18, 2016 at 1:16 PM, 
wrote: 

Jeffrey 

=< <mailto > > 

attached for your review, estimates for the refinishing of PRD Hull and =opside 
Photo's showing present condition of PRD and Cushions=/div> 
Carlos recommends Kenny's Yacht Maintenance performs the wor= on LSJ- see attached E mail 
Carlos is having issue getting repl=cement fittings for Cape Horn, i would estimate the following 

Hull and Topside $7870.00 
Cushions and covers $3000.=0 
Fittings $1000.00 
Stereo and Speakers $1000.00 =/div> 

Estimated Total $12,7870.00 

<=iv>Please note cushions are already been removed delivered for repair 
Do we have your approval to proceed with the remaining work. 

/strong> 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, =ay be attorney-client privileged, may 
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constitute inside information, an= is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of.IEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication o= any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you hare received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by=br>return e-mail or by e-mail to 

jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communicat=on and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all ri=hts reserved 
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