From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Friday, December 9, 2016 6:04 PM
To: Richard Kahn
Subject: Re: legistation invoice

ignore for now

On Fri, Dec 9, 2016 at 1:53 P, Richard kahn < - -

43 days later she responds..

billed to date: 109,301
paid to date: 29,292 (paid by jee per dki approval from jee on 9=21/2016)
balance outstanding 80,009

please advise
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
M=w York, NY 10022

Subject:=Re: legistation invoice

==pan style="font-family:-webkit-system-font,Helvetica Neue,Helvetica,sans=serif;color:rgba(0,0,0,1.0)">Date:
December 8, 2016=at 3:56:12 PM EST

=br>
We need to talk about this. If you can tell me in advance wha= the concerns are I'll be able to address them on
the call.

Erika A. Kellerhals
Member
Kellerhals Ferguson Kroblin PLLC

9053 Estate Thomas, Suite 101
St. T=omas, VI 00802
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MNotice: This communicat=on may contain privileged or other confidential information. If you =re not the
intended recipient, or believe that you have received this comms=nication in error, please do not print, copy, re-transmit,
disseminate, or=otherwise use this information. Also, please indicate to the sender =hat you have received this e-mail in
error, and delete the copy you receiv=d. Thank you.

Circular 230: To ensure compliance with the=requirements imposed by the IRS, we inform you that any tax
advice contain=d in our communication (including any attachments) was not intended or wri=ten to be used, and cannot
be used, for the purpose of (i) avoiding any ta= penalty or (ii) promoting, marketing or recommending to another party
any=transaction or matter addressed herein.

=C24) Yes — | have some meetings in the morning, but | will g=ve you a ring when they are done.

Erika A. =ellerhals

Member

Kellerhals F=rguson Kroblin PLLC

Royal Palm Professional Building=br> 9053 Estate Thomas, Suite 101
=t. Thomas, VI 00802

Notice: This communication may con=ain privileged or other confidential information. If you are not
the=intended recipient, or believe that you have received this communication i= error, please do not print, copy, re-
transmit, disseminate, or otherwise =se this information. Also, please indicate to the sender that you ha=e received this
e-mail in error, and delete the copy you received. T=ank you.

Circular 230: To ensure compliance =ith the requirements imposed by the IRS, we inform you that any tax
advice=contained in our communication (including any attachments) was not intende= or written to be used, and cannot
be used, for the purpose of (i) avoidin= any tax penalty or (ii) promoting, marketing or recommending to another p=rty
any transaction or matter addressed herein.

wrote:=br>
we never connected
=C24 iam free tomorrow all day if you=are available
thank you
<=r> Richard Kahn
=C24p HBRK Associates Inc.
=C24p 575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
0-:#.[! New York, NY 10022

=C1@
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On Oct 28= 2016, at 65:59 AM, Erika Kellerhals _
<t > ot

Ri=h - my day is a little hectic today. | think Monday morning might be
ea=ier for me.

Erika A. Kellerhals

Member

Kellerhals Ferguson =roblin PLLC
Rovyal Palms Professional Building
9053 Estate Thomas, Su=te 101
5t. Thomas, W1 00802

Motice: This communicatio= may contain privileged or other confidential
information. If you=are not the intended recipient, or believe that you
have received this =ommunication in error, please do not print, copy,
re-transmit, dissemin=te, or otherwise use this information. Also, please
indicate to t=e sender that you have received this e-mail in error, and
delete the co=y you received. Thank you.

Circular 230: To ensure compli=nce with the requirements imposed by the
IRS, we inform you that any ta= advice contained in our communication
{including any attachments) was =ot intended or written to be used, and
cannot be used, for the purpose =f (i) avoiding any tax penalty or [ii)
promoting, marketing or recommen=ing to another party any transaction or
matter addressed herein.

On 10/27/16, 5:50 PM, "Richard Kahn" «:_fz:a:» wrote:

lets talk tomorrow regarding=payment
thanks

Richard Kahn
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HBRK Associates Inc.
575 Lexin=ton Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

=br=

please note

The inform=tion contained in this communication is

confidential, may be attorney-c=ient privileged, may

constitute inside information, and is intended onl= for

the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthor=zed use, disclosure or copying of this

communication or any part thereo=is strictly prohibited

and may be unlawful. If you have received this<=r=communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail=or by e-mail to <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com= , and
destroy this communication and all copie= thereof,

including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

=/div>
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