
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, December 15, 2016 12:40 AM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: LS1 chalkboard 

yes 

On Wed, Dec 14, 2016 at 7:34 PM, Richard Kahn From: LSJ GSJ 

S=bject: LSJ_CC_PAYMENT_5,824.00_121416 

Date: De=ember 14, 2016 at 1:49:02 PM EST 

To: Richard Kahn , =aphne Wallace 

Good Afternoon Rich=br>JE has approved the purchase of a chalkboard for LSJ Balance Due $5,=24.00 Deposit $1,295.00 
was paid on my LSJ AMEX Please advise which=CC you would like the balance due to be paid on. 
Thank you 
Warmest r=gards 

Sent from my iPhone 

=C2 please note 

The informat=on contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-cli=nt privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only =or the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthoriz=d use, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof =s strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this 

return e-mail o= by e-mail to j=evacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this 
communication and all copies =hereof, including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved g=iv> 
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