
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, December 13, 2016 8:40 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: GS) 3 phase output 

ok 

On Tue, Dec 13, 2016 at 3:38 PM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

i reviewed attached to danny today and=he was in favor of this upgrade 
danny explained that we are curr=ntly maxed out on amps 
3 phase will divide into thirds so it wil= increase our ampage dramatically 

brad would not =udge on price but said he would be able to give us a credit for our invert=rs of 4,000 so net cost 
would be 33,235 

they would do all prep w=rk next week and in 6 weeks when equipment arrives system will be online i= 1 day 
please advise if ok to proceed 
thank youadiv> 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

=C24> please note 

The informat=on contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-cli=nt privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only =or 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthoriz=d use, disclosure or copying of this 
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communication or any part thereof =s strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 

return e-mail o= by e-mail to j=evacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies =hereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
chiv> 
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