From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, December 5, 2016 4:13 PM
To: Lesley Groff; Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: SPR17_INVOICE.pdf - OneDrive
ok

On Mon, Dec 5, 2016 at 12:12 PM, Lesley Groff t::_ -:mailm_:t > wrote:

Invoice fur- school...She says she asked if you would continue to =elp her pay for school and you said
yes...This is her invoice for Sp=in 2017 Due Jan. 3rd.

https://on=drive.live.com/?authkey=%21AM8YY3Zulq%2DkUGY&cid=0CEC20F=B18FD6CF&id=CEC20F2B18FD6
CF%211866&parld=CEC20F2B1BF=6CF%211707&0=0nelp

<https://onedrive.live.com/?authkey=%21AMEYY3Zulg%2DkUGY&ci==0CECZ0F2B18FD6CF&Id=CEC20F2B18FDECF%:21
18668&parld=CEC20F2B18=D6CF%211707&0=0nelUp>

=br>

please =ote

The information contained in this communication is confiden=ial, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute
inside informati=n, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the propert= of JEE Unauthorized use,
disclosure or copying of this communica=ion or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If =ou have
received this communication in error, please notify us immediat=ly by return e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail=com> , and destroy this comm=nication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -=Il rights reserved
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