
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, November 8, 2016 10:23 AM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: invoice - ion nicola 

Ok 

On Tuesday, November 8, 2016, Richard Kahn < 
wrote: 

<mailto: 

Attached is ion invoice for 2= days x 303 per day plus expenses totaling 9,011.35 Please advis= if ok to pay. 
Thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBR= Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New Y=rk, NY 10022 
Tel 
Fax 
Cell 

Begin forwarded message: 
=br> 

From: ion nicola < 
Date: November 7= 2016 at 9:01:50 PM EST 
To: Richard Kahn < 
Subject: invoice - ion=nicola 

hi rich, 

how are you? i hope you are well 

i am still in Isj.. 

i attached to this e-mail my invoice ($8,181) and some expenses receipts=($830.35) 

so the total would be $9,011.35 
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thank you, 

ion 

=/blockquote> 

=C2 please note 

The information contained in this communic=tion is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constit=te 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addresse=. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying =f this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and =ay be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in error, pleas= notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com, and<=r>destroy this communication and all copies thereof, including all atta=hments. copyright 
-all rights reserved 
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