From: I

Sent: Wednesday, September 25, 2013 7:44 PM

To: Je vacation; Rich Kahn

Subject: Fw: GIV final invoice

Attachments: image001 jpg; image002.jpg; image003.jpg; 13127 final invoice.PDF
Jeffrey,

I'm still waiting sub woofer car stereo person to arrive at GIV, | informed Eric | want different Subs. | told Eric no
payment until this is resolved! His final invoice is attached.

If you elect to leave GIV with Eric new camera can be completed by Oct 7th, according to Roth, engineering and other
bull.

Its 4 days to install.

Roth says he has to provide you a quote for camera install, we've been waiting for this since sept 7th, when he first
realized the replacement camera would not work.

Thx
Larry
Sent via BlackBerry by ATET

From: Eric Roth |

Date: Wed, 25 Sep 2013 14:45:22 -0400
To: 'Larry Visoski'
Subject: FW: GIV final invoice

Please review and forward to Rich Kahn.

Payment is due in full by wire transfer.

Thank you.

EFTA_R1_01948767
EFTA02673203



ERIC H. ROTH | PRESIDENT

2221 Smithtown Avenue, Long Island MacArthur Airport, Ronkonkoma, New York 11775

From: Eileen |

Sent: Wednesday, September 25, 2013 2:15 PM
To: Eric Roth
Subject: GIV final invoice

Eric,

See attached

EILEEMN CRAIG | ACCOUNTING

2221 Smithtown Avenue, Long Island MacArthur Airport, Ronkonkoma, New York 11779

EFTA_R1_01948768

EFTA02673204



