From: Richard kahn <

Sent: Monday, August 19, 2013 8:08 PM

To: Jeffrey Epstein

Subject: aspen landscaping

Attachments: SKMBT_C25313081915220.pdf; Untitled attachment 00430.htm

-:a:ﬂ submitted Aspen final check request on August 7th in the amount of =7,438.42 which i have not released

Aspen Total Job: =5,000.00
Paid to Date: =7,561.58

Unpaid amount: =7,438.42

Brice states that although Cypress =amp; Junipers were not planted other areas were added such as library =eds 4,517
(see attached) Brice paperwork states that Aspen =evised cost actually increased to 78,595.23 but only billed 75,000
=riginal amount Please note that the original 75,000 price =ncluded gross receipts tax Please =dvise

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 =exington Avenue, 4th Floor,
New York, New York 10022

tel
fax
cell

Begin forwarded message:

Date: August 19, 2013 3:23:36 PM EDT

Subject: Message from KMBT_C253

Reply-To: [

EFTA_R1_01952358
EFTA02673762



