From: Richard kahn

Sent: Friday, March 1, 2013 5:40 PM

To: Jeffrey Epstein

Cc: Jeanne Brennan

Subject: Fwd: LSJ_PETER_CK_022813_%1,000.00

Attachments: LSJ_PETERL_CK_022813_%1,000.00.pdf; Untitled attachment 00501.htm

This is another one of - antics..

Peter was =ired for 2 weeks work for 52,000 to assist Danny When we =uestioned dates seeing only 9 days were worked
I <:olains that =fter speaking with Danny, Peter worked 1 extra hour each day so =hat qualifies as 10th day..
Unfortunately when bill was =resented for payment none of this was =isclosed

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 =exington Avenue, 4th Floor,
New York, New York 10022

Begin forwarded message:

From: "leanne Brennan" :It-

Date: March 1, 2013 =1:35:36 AM EST

Subject: FW: =5J_PETER_CK_022813_51,000.00

Thanks
Warmest =egards

Sent from my =Phone
Begin forwarded message:

From: | <
Cc: leanne

Subject: LS)_PETER_CK_022813_%$1,000=00

EFTA_R1_01960691
EFTA02675148



Good Afternoon =adies,
=ttached Check Request for Peter Lunz, who has completed his 2 weeks =ontracted work. Could this

check please be available tomorrow =orning?

Thank =ou

Warmest =egards

L5J,LLC

Island Manager

6100 Red Hook Quarters Suite B3

St =homas

LSV 00802

EFTA_R1_01960692
EFTA02675149



