
From: Larry Visoski 
Sent: Thursday, January 14, 2016 6:23 PM 
To: Je vacation; Rich Kahn 
Subject: Fwd: N9081E TCAS 
Attachments: image001.png; Untitled attachment 00325.htm; image002.png; Untitled attachment 

00328.htm; image003.png; Untitled attachment 00331.htm; image004.png; Untitled 
attachment 00334.htm; imageO0Sjpg; Untitled attachment 00337.htm; 82464.pdf; 
Untitled attachment 00340.htm; Untitled attachment 00343.pdf; Untitled attachment 
00346.htm 

Jeffrey 
TCAS installed in B727 
$41,966.=2 
Is this approved to wire payment? 

Th= 
Larryv 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Yeimi Montoya 
Date: Janus 14, 2016 at 1:20:13 P= EST 
To: 
Cc: Erica H=rnandez 

44
Subject: N908JE 

=/div> 

Good afternoon 

Christopher Jelinek 

Please find attached invoice for TCAS processor updat= along with wire transfer instructions for payment. Do 
not hesitate to give=us a call if you have any questions. 

Best regards 

EFTA_R1_01964385 
EFTA02675762



Yeimi Montoya 

Avionics Adminis=rator 

Dedicated to earning customer loyalty th=ough excellence in aviation services.<=span> 

Banyan Air Services, Inc. =main 

www.banyanair.com <http://www.banyanair.com> 
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