
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Monday, February 1 , 14 : 
To: Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: Tyler 
Attachments: inhibitor cocktails.docx; Untitled attachment 00691.htm; Nat Geo Topics.docx; Untitled 

attachment 00694.htm 

i =ave attached correspondence from Tyler and when i last =resented tyler invoice to you on 1/29 in the 
amount of $13,411.04 for =ec 2013 and January 2014 and you said no i have not communicated that =o tyler 
now says he is on hold until he is =aid please advise if i should pay invoice and if so what =mount 

On Jan 29, 2014, at =:10 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> =rote: 

no 

On Wed, Jan 29, =014 at 4:58 PM, Richard Kahn •t ,- wrote: 

Attached is Tyler Invoice =or December 2013 & January 2014 Time and Expenses in the amount of =3,411.04 

For reference his previous invoices to date =re as follows: 

August 2013 =/span>9,250.00 
September 2013 12,397.77 
October 2013 =/span>9,050.00 
November 2013 6,524.08 

Paid to Date: =nbsp;37,221.85 
Total Billed (Aug 2013 • Jan 2014): =nbsp;50,632.89 

Please advise if ok to =ay 

<=iv> 
Richard Kahn 
From♦ 

Begin =orwarded message: 
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From: Tyler Shears 
</=iv> 
Subject: =/b>Fwd: nat geo article 

Date: February 10, 2014 =:35:58 AM EST 

To: Richard Kahn 

Touching base on last invoice = have new expenses this month and want to confirm we are =K 

Sorry for phone message just landed at =irport 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded =essage: 

From:
Date: February 10, 2014 at 1:07:23 AM =ST 
To: Tyler Shears cs ' 'effrey =pstein <jeevacation@gmail.corn> 
=ubject: nat :eo article 
Reply-To 

Hi =yler, 

attached is the feature article for ntl. =eorgraphic. I highlighted the spots with Jeffrey's name. =/div> 
attached also are suggested article topics for =hem. 

I also have a press release which I will =end to you tomorrow.-

Thank =ou, 
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