
From: Richard Kahn <
Sent: Friday, March 15, 2013 1:57 PM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: Fwd: Final Invoice 
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confirming that outstanding balance of $1,613.24 is =till on hold 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 =exington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel = 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Jeff Sternhell" 

Date: March 14, 2013 3:24:06 PM EDT 

To: "Richard Kahn" 

Cc: c >

Subject: RE: Final Invoice 

Richard: 
We still haven't received payment for the =ompletion of the 6th floor media room as =pecified in the change 

order proposal dated 11/27/12. The same way Mr. =pstein expects his system to be serviced in a timely manner when 
either =dding equipment or fixing something that is malfunctioning we expect to =e extended the same courtesy when 
it's time to pay a bill. =nbsp;Again I've attached the final invoice, if there is any issue =lease contact me. 

Best 
Jeff 

Jeff Sternhell 
Vice =resident 
Cutting Edge Systems 

www.cuttingedge-systems.com 

EFTA_R1_01983325 
EFTA02679443



Cc: 
Richard: 
Attached please find the final invoice for 71st street, once =e receive payment I will forward to Richard Barnett 

the up-to-date =rchived version of the program for you to do with as you =lease. 
Best 
Jeff 

Jeff Sternhell 
Vice =resident 
Cutting Edge Systems 

www.cuttingedge-systems.com 
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