
From: Richard Kahn < 
Sent: Thursday, March 7, 2013 10:16 PM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: Fwd: LSJ Cisterns 
Attachments: LSJ Cisterns 12 & 3.xls; Untitled attachment 00187.htm 

brice =as requested deposit of 16,700 be paid for cistern #2 total =ob cost is 20,876 is this ok to =elease? 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 =exington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York. New York 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: brice gordon < 

Date: February 24, 2013 1:44:00 PM EST 

To: Rich Kahn < 

Cc: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: LSJ =isterns 

Rich 

Jeffrey wishes =o move forward with the repair of the cisterns at LSJ 
I have =ttached proposal for your reference, let me know when we can discuss =etails. 
regards 

Brice Gordon 

USVI 
Phone: 

New =exico 
Phone: 
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