
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Thursday, December 20, 2012 9:38 PM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: re: Cisterns 
Attachments: LSJ Cistems.pdf; Untitled attachment 00916.htm 

Today = received a $8,500 deposit check for cistern work totaling =3,200 Is it ok to release to Dennis Barrett? 
Please =dvise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 =exington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

 Forwarded messa e —
From: brice gordon 
Date: Thu, Nov 8, 2012 at 7:57 AM 
Subject: RE Cisterns 
To: Jeffrey =pstein <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» 

JeffreyAttached for your review is the bid to repair and refurbish the 3 =interns, Bedroom 1, Bedroom 2 and 
Great Room in the main =ompound. 

Estimated time 3 weeks. 
Total Cost including =aterial: $13,200.0 
Rooms 1 and 2 will be effected by this work, covers to cisterns are =nside those rooms 

Past bids, dated 3/2/12 from Phillip Mark where 
Cistern =: $11,600.00 material to be supplied by LSJ 
Cistern 2: =10,200.00 material to be supplied by LSJ 

Shall =e proceed? 

Brice Gordon 
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