
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Monday, July 30, 2012 2:44 PM 
To: Jeffre E stein 
Cc: 
Subject: Fwd: Turkey to Patmos 
Attachments: CREDIT CARD PAYMENT FORM-2011.pdf; Untitled attachment 00432.htm 

is this leg approved as Peggy assistant states =elow 

480O€ (Caravan =or 04Aug Dalaman to Mykonos, flight time 1 hour), USD =016 

if so =hould i pay from HBRK or JEE? 
please =dvise 

PLEASE NOTE EFFECTIVE JUNE 5TH MY CONTACT INFO WILL BE AS =OLLOWS: 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates =nc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, =th Floor, 

10022 

fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Allison Reddington =It; 

Date: July 30, 2012 10:35:34 AM EDT 

To: 

Cc: "miltos@magna-aviation.com" =Itmiltos@magna-aviation.com>=, 'bps@magna-aviation.com 
<mailto:ops@magna-aviation.com> " =lt;ops@magna-aviation.com>, 

Subject: FW: Turkey to =atmos 

Hi =ichard, 

Hope you enjoyed your weekend! 

EFTA_R1_01989458 
EFTA02680690



Peggy and Jeffrey spoke and as =f now, Jeffrey will be paying for the twin engine from Dalaman to =ykonos and 
Peggy will being paying for the chopper to =atmos. 

It is still up in the air what will happen on Friday, =ugust 10th. 

I have cc'd Milton from Magna Aviation and have attached =he credit card payment form for you. 

Please let me know if =ou require any further assistance. 

Thank you and I look =orward to hearing back from you. 

Best, 
Allison 
JEEVACATION@GMAIL.COM 
Cc: Allison Reddington; Peggy =iegal; Lesley Groff ( <mailto:lesley.jee@gmail.com> 
Here is the break down on the three =lights that I would like for Turkey and Greece. 

My contact from the company =s Miltos Mouzakis of Magna Aviation =+30.6982.333.444 miltos@magna-
aviation.com). 

The total cost in US dollars is around $12,721. Please let =e know if this is okay and thank you again. 

xoxo, 
Peggy 

4800€ (Caravan for 04Aug Dalaman =o Mykonos, flight time 1 hour), USD =016 
2250E (Bell 407 for 04Aug Mykonos =0 Patmos, flight time 26mins), USD =820 
3100E (Robinson R44 for 10Aug =atmos to Athens, flight time lh 30mins), USD =885 
Total Cost: 4800+2250+3100 = EUR =0150 (all incl) / or 6016$+2820$+3885$= USD =2'721 

As discussed we can accept =SD, but only the above amount, as this is the rate our bank will =onvert is back to 
Euro. 
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