
From: Rich Kahn 
Sent: Wednesday, January 26, 2011 6:46 PM 
To: jeevacation@gmail.com 
Subject: FW: CC-JE-Williams-Sonoma-1-26-11 
Attachments: CC-JE-Williams-Sonoma-1-26-11.pdf 

Not sure if you are interested but his purchase is something that we =ould use American Express points to pay with 

700,000 points = $7000 

Your current amex point balance is: 1,609,000 

Please note Sarah has not yet given me direction on 1,000,000 points =e discussed 

Rich =ahn 

HBRK =ssociates Inc. 

301 East =6th Street, Suite 1OF 

New York, =Y 10065 

tel 

fax 

cell 

From:=Th 
Sent: Wednesday, =anuary 26, 2011 12:03 PM 
To: 
Cc: Rich Kahn; Emad =anna 
Subject: =C-JE-Williams-Sonoma-1-26-11 

Good Afternoon, 

EFTA_R1_01999445 
EFTA02683166



FYI - Attached =ist of items that were approved by JE and purchased on his Credit =ard with a total of $6,940.90 If there 
are any questions or =oncerns please call Warmest regards 
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EFTA_R1_01999446 
EFTA02683167


