
From: Rich Kahn 
Sent: Monday, December 6, 2010 4:40 PM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: FW: Peggy Siegal Invoice 
Attachments: PSC1002JeffreyEpstein.pdf 

Attached is invoice from Peggy for 30,000 

Is this ok to pay? 

If so from HBRK (how we paid last invoice) or your personal =ccount? 

Rich =ahn 

HBRK =ssociates Inc. 

301 East =6th Street, Suite 1OF 

New York, =Y 10065 

tel 

fax = 

cell 

From:=/b> =eanna Romeo [mailt 
Sent: Monday, =ecember 06, 2010 5:22 AM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: =eggy Siegal Invoice 

Rich, 

I hope this e-mail finds you =ell! 

I was asked to submit an invoice for Peggy which I have =ttached. I will supply her wire information under separate 
=over. 

Many thanks! 

Deanna M. Romeo 
waggingtail =ntertainment limited 
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Peggy Siegal Inc. 
900 Broadway, Suite =00 
New York, NY 10003 

750 Lexington Avenue, 5th Floor 
New =ork, NY 10022 
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