
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Thursday, March 24, 2011 11:55 AM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: FW: Invoice for PR Services 
Attachments: P511101HBRKJEpstein24March.pdf 

Please advise 

./div> 
From: Deanna Romeo 
Date: Thu, 24 Mar 2011 05:12:39 -0400 
To: "HBRK Inc." 

Cc: 
Subject: Invoice for PR =ervices 

Rich, 

I hope this e-mail finds you well! 

I have attached an invoice for PR Services for Peggy Siegal. Please let me =now if you need anything else to process 
payment. 

In addition, I wanted to inquire about the remaining balance from St. Bart'=. Should I submit a separate invoice for that 
amount? 

Many thanks! 

Deanna M. Romeo 
waggingtail entertainment limited 
Peggy Siegal Inc. 
900 Broadway, Suite 400 
New York, NY 10003 

750 Lexington Avenue, 5th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
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