From:

Sent: Thursday, April 28, 2011 1:47 PM
To: Jeffrey Epstein

Subject: Gary Kerney April invoice
Attachments:

attached is Gary's April invoice in the amount of 24,295 40 please =dvise if i should pay this week

Richard Kahn

Richard =ahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

301 East 66th Street, Suite =0F
New York, NY 10065

Begin forwarded message:

Date: April 19, 2011 12:43:40 PM EDT

Subject: RE: April invoice

=ich
Attached =nvoice, Thanks

Gary

From: Richard kahn -

Sent: Tue 4/19/2011 9:49 =M
To: Gary Kerney
Subject: Re: April =nvoice

i could not open file
please resend
thank you

Richard Kahn

INVOICE FOR  April 19.docy; Untitled attachment 00286.htm
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HBRK Associates Inc.
301 East 66th =treet, Suite 10F
New York, NY 10065

On Apr 13, 2011, at 6:25 PM, Gary Kerney wrote:

Rich
Attached my April =nvoice,please fund by the end of the month,
Thanks

Gary
<INVOICE =pril.wps>

=/div=
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