From: Richard Kahn N

Sent: Friday, August 29, 2014 12:32 PM
To: Jeffrey Epstein
Subject: Fwd: Re: Re:

Sent from my iPhone
=br>Begin forwarded message:

-rom; *Adam zygowski * [ R

Date: August 29, 2014 at 7:41:00 AM ED=

To: "Daphne Wallace" <
Cc: "Richard Kahn"

Subject:=/b> Re: Re:

Hi Daphne,

W= are still during montage - please see the enclosed pics.

T= finish the installation we need some cables, engine connector etc for whic= we must wait (| don't know how long).
If we had the origin=| installation made in USVI, we would be already after testing.

<=pan>Now we have to spend a lot of money for custom and one-time solution.</=pan>

Best regards
Adam Zygowski

Dnia 28-08-2014 o 15:53:20 Daphne Wallace_:

Greetings Ada=,

Checking in with you to see if the eng=ne mounting has been successfully

napisaf(a):
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i assume you received the engines yesterday

please advise on your test results

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor

==blockquote>

New York, NY 10022

</=lockquote=

--=br=

SPORTIS 5.A.
2
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www.sportis.com.pl <http://www.sportis.com.pl> <=r>

http://www.facebook.com/pages/SPORTIS/151189274950385

<http://www.facebook.com/pages/SPORT=5/151189274950385>

http://twitt=r.com/#|/sportis_sa <http://twitter.com/#!/sportis_sa>

https://plus.google.com/109174365046263030394

<https://plus.google.co=/109174365046263030394> </=pan>

Gdarisk.

=blockquote type="cite">
Rejestracja: 53= Rejonowy Gdansk Pdinoc Oddzial w Gdansku,<=r>

VIl Wydziat Gospodarczy KRS nr 0000067475,

kapitat zaktadowy: 2.058.170 PLN w catosci op€=82acony.

Regon 191726929, NIP 588-18-40-279

<=pan>

Registered with no: 0000067475 in Regional Court Gda=C54psk-Potnoc in

Share capital: 2.058.=70 PLN Paid. VAT UE: PL58B1840279

EFTA_R1_02022251
EFTA02688778



=br>

<=span=

SPORTIS 5.A.
24-207 Koleczkowo

www.sporti=.com.pl <http://www.sportis.com.pl>

http://www facebook.com/pages/SPORTIS/15=189274950385
<http://www.facebook=com/pages/SPORTIS/151189274950385>

http://twitter.com/#!/sportis_sa <http://twitter.com/#!/sportis_s=>

https://plus.google.com/10917436504626=030394
<https://p=us.google.com/109174365046263030394>

Rejestracja: 53d Rejon=wy Gdansk Polnoc Oddziat w Gdanisku,
VIll Wydziat Gospodarczy KRS nr 0000067475,

kapita€p=82 zakladowy: 2.058.170 PLN w catosci optacony.</=pan>
Regon 191726929, NIP 588-18-40-279

Registered with no: 0000067475 in Regional Court Gdanisk-Pot=oc in Gdarisk.
Share capital: 2.058.170 PLN Paid. VAT U=: PL 5881840279
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