From: Richard Kahn

Sent: Tuesday, March 6, 2012 8:34 PM

To: Jeffrey Epstein

Subject: VI Gunite Pools

Attachments: SKMBT_C25312030616140.pdf; Untitled attachment 00031.htm

i =ant to apologize as | just reviewed schedule and realized it had a =istake. attached is adjusted schedule showing the
=ollowing:

total unpaid should be 48,742.19 which is =ade up of the following:

a) 14,000 (payment 2 =f 2 on 2012 main house pool agreement)
b) 34,742.19 (last =0,000 from original flagpole pool & 14,742.19 in change =rders)

i just reconfirmed this with =rice

Richard =ahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

301 East 66th Street, Suite =0F
New York, NY 10065

tel

fax

cel

Begin forwarded message:

Date: March &, 2012 3:14:52 PM EST

Subject: Message from KMBT_C253

Reply-To:

EFTA_R1_02054930
EFTA02697360



