
From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Jeffrey <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Saturday, April 21, 2012 7:50 AM 

That agreement can set aside the settlement . It is a part of it . Where is t=e 175k from elite 

Sorry for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone 

On Apr 20, 2012, at 8:37 PM, wrote: 

> Theres another agreement between imads company 'new amsterdam investment' a=d mine, regarding Elite 

> Thats the one that will get translated this weekend 

> Thanks for your help 
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> <Settlement Agreement.pdf> 
<?xml version=.0" encoding=TF-8"?> 
<!DOCTYPE plist PUBLIC "-//Apple//DTD PLIST 1.0//EN" "http://www.apple.com/DTDs/Propertylist-1.0.dtd"> 
<plist version=.0"> 
<dict> 

<key>date-last-viewed</key> 
<integer>0</integer> 
<key>date-received</key> 
<integer>1334994506</integer> 
<key>flags</key> 
<integer>8590195713</integer> 
<kepremote-id</key> 
<string>218507</string> 

</dict> 
</plist> 
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