From: richard kahn

Sent: Wednesday, October 31, 2012 8:25 PM

To: Jeffrey Epstein

Subject: Fwd: Gotham Awards Chairs

Attachments: viewrpt.pdf.pdf; Untitled attachment 00024.htm

Flease advise if ok to pay Peggy invoice in the =mount of 7,239.60 if so from what entity? jee, hbrk, =nhanced..

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 =exington Avenue, 4th Floor,
New York, New York 10022

Begin forwarded message:

From: IFP Business Office :Il_

<=5pan:
Date: October 31, 2012 3:59:27 PM EDT

ce: sponsorship { GG
=/div=
Subject: RE: Gotham =wards Chairs

Hello Allison and Richard:

As for color, Party Rental would like you to know that the =ame brown chairs are no longer available... and the
replacement is =ruitwood with brown velvet cushion

From: Allison Reddington =mailto
Sent: Friday, October 26, 2012 =:31 PM
To: I : (P Business =ffice

Subject: Gotham Awards =hairs
Dear Richard and Mitch,

Hope you are both =ell.

I would like to =ntroduce you two to one another as Jeffrey has graciously offered to =ay the 58,000 for the
ballroom chairs for the Gotham =wards.

EFTA_R1_02074172
EFTA02702352



Peggy spoke about having dark brown wood chairs with brown =elvet cushions.
Please let me know if you require any further =ssistance.

Best,
Allison

Allison Reddington
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