
From: Richard Joslin 
Sent: Thursday, May 5, 2016 10:22 PM 
To: Brad Wechsler; 'jeevacation@qmail.com' 
Subject: RE: Re: 
Attachments: GRAT 2 ANALYSIS.PDF; BFP VALUATION GROSS TO NET DISCOUNTED VALUE.pdf 

Two files 

1) Empire Gross Asset Value to net discounted value from 2013 to 2015 for selected valuations 

2) the change over time (lower) of Empire's trading restriction discount on APO stock (sent Nov 2015) 

From: Brad Wechsle 
Sent: Thursday, May 05, 2016 2:46 PM 
To: ljeevacation@gmail.com' <jeevacation@gmail.com>; Richard Joslin 
Subject: Re: 

Ok 

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.comj 
Sent: Thursday, May 05, 2016 02:27 PM 
To: Brad Wechsler 
Subject: Re: 

its says grat discount 36 %. . next quarter 34.4% or something close. 

On Thu, May 5, 2016 at 2:20 PM, Brad Wechsler >  wrote: 

He's looking thru his emails and other materials and will forward but he seemed unclear... 

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> ] 
Sent: Thursday, May 05, 2016 01:30 PM 
To: Brad Wechsler 
Subject: 
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ask jolsin for the chart that shows grat discount at 36 point something percent. , then later at 35 .something 
, it is a hard copy in my office in new york 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

www.imax.com <http://www.imax.com> 
IMAX' is a registered trademark of IMAX Corporation. 

IMPORTANT NOTICE 
Information contained in this e-mail correspondence and any attachments is confidential information intended 

only for the use of the individual or entity named above. 
Any reader of this message who is not the intended recipient of this correspondence is hereby notified that any 

dissemination, distribution, copying 
or communication of the contents of this correspondence is strictly prohibited. If this e-mail was not addressed 

to you , please immediately notify us 
by phone in Canada at (905) 403.6500 <tel:%28905%29%20403.6500> (collect calls will be accepted) or by 

email at webmaster@imax.com <mailto:webmaster@imax.com> and delete and destroy this 
correspondence inadvertently sent to you. Thank you 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
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jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

www.imax.com <http://www.imax.com> 
'MAX. is a registered trademark of IMAX Corporation. 

IMPORTANT NOTICE 
Information contained in this e-mail correspondence and any attachments is confidential information intended only for 
the use of the individual or entity named above. 
Any reader of this message who is not the intended recipient of this correspondence is hereby notified that any 
dissemination, distribution, copying or communication of the contents of this correspondence is strictly prohibited. If 
this e-mail was not addressed to you , please immediately notify us by phone in Canada at (905) 403-6500 (collect calls 
will be accepted) or by email at webmaster@imax.com <mailto:webmaster@imax.com> and delete and destroy this 
correspondence inadvertently sent to you. Thank you 
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