From: richard Kahn [

Sent: Friday, April 22, 2016 6:00 PM

To: jeffrey E.

Subject: Fwd: boysan credit

Attachments: Boyson Balance.pdf; Untitled attachment 00060.htm

FYl - we are still owed 23k
Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:
From: =/b>Daphne Wallace _
Subject: =/b>Re: boyson

Date: =/b=April 22, 2016 at 1:58:17 PM =DT

To:=/b>Richard Kah
ce: ann rodrique: I

Greetings =ich,

The credit =alance as of 12/9/2015is $23,412.50. | called Andrea at Boyson =ust now to obtain any invoices for
any runs that were made between =2/3/2015 and when they were shut down.

Andrea says JR never submitted =dditional transport reports to her, and she doubts that he recalls, so =he credit
balance as of the |last invoice of 12/9/2015 will have to =tand.

On Fri, Apr 22, 2016 at 12:30 PM, Richard Kahn =span dir="Itr" cIass:"":-_ wrote:

can you please send =rint out of our credit that remains with them
thanks
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Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022
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