From: Richard Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, December 3, 2012 10:16 PM

To: Jeffrey Epstein

Subject: Fwd: outstanding invoice payment

Attachments: epstein.EPS.002.09.10.1 2xls.pdf; Untitled attachment 00184.htm

after speaking with jeff today they are refusing to =omplete remaining work until we pay for shade panel repair and
=roubleshooting in the amount of 2,449.68 please =dvise

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 =exington Avenue, 4th Floor,
New York, New York 10022

tel =
fax
cell

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Jeff Sternhell” =It;jeff @cuttingedge-systems.com<=a>>

Date: December 3, 2012 12:06:42 PM EST

To: "Richard Kahn" =lt;richardkahnl12@gmail.com:

Cc: «<danny@cuttingedge-systems.co=2>, "Scott Denett” <sdenett@me.com:

Subject: outstanding =nvoice payment

Richard:

Regarding our conversation this morning we cannot move =orward on any new work that was agreed upon as
per my meeting with the =rincipal last week until we are paid in full for work completed back in =eptember for the
media room, that being repair and labor of the shades. ='ve attached the invoice once again and after receiving the
54838.61 =rom you we are still owed $2449 .68, please pay this outstanding amount =0 the next 2 agreed upon phases
(see below) can be completed before the =rincipal returns.

Upgrade =he gym system, holding off on a new TV until newer models come out in =arly 2013
Best
Jeff

Jeff Sternhell

Vice =resident

Cutting Edge =ystems
jeff@cuttingedge-systems.com
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