
From: Richard Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, November 30, 2012 5:12 PM 
To: Svet 
Cc: Jeffrey Epstein 
Attachments: Selena P current 11-13-12 NY.pdf; Untitled attachment 00031.htm 

From: Jean Luc Brunel <jeanluc@mc2mm.com> 

Date: November 29, 2012 =:36:21 PM EST 

richardkahn12@gmail.com" =lt;richardkahnl2@gmail.com> 

From: Dominique Nameche 
Sent: Thursday, =ovember 29, 2012 05:44 PM 
To: Jean Luc =runel 
Subject: FW: RE: Fwd: =E: 

Hi Richard, 

You are right, but in the meantime Selana owes us some =oney and got a negative balance on her statement for the 
following : =isa processing fee, Test with photographer, Website fee, courrier, =omcards, appt rent. 

I will have the 20% fee reverse to her account and will =ave that amount applied the negative balance owes to =C2 and 
if any balance due to Selana, I will have a check cut to =er. 
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