From: wchard tonn [

Sent: Tuesday, June 11, 2013 3:39 PM

To: Jeffrey Epstein

Subject: Fwd: AYH- outstanding balance FYI

Attachments: 20130610115541521 pdf; Untitled attachment 00176.htm

Attached is outstanding LSJ invoices from AYH =otaling 38,173.11
The breakdown is as =ollows:;

a) LS) Boats Slips, Water, Utilities =8,648.17
b) Fuel Purchases =9,524.94

Leah new manager at AYH is asking =hat we pay the fuel since that was an out of pocket cost for =YH Please advise.

Richard Kahn

HBRE Associates Inc.

575 =exington Avenue, 4th Floor,
New York, New York 10022

tel
fax
cell

Begin forwarded message:

Date: June 10, 2013 =2:15:14 PM EDT
To: "'Richard Kahn™
Ce: "'Daphne Walla

Subject: AYH- outstanding =alance FY|

Leah Hicks (new GM - replaced =oe) and Beth (bookkeeper ) came to office today to discuss the =utstanding

accounts.

Tone - very nice.
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