
From: bellaklein 
Sent: Wednesday, March 5, 2014 12:52 PM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: Fwd: 
Attachments: 3233828 inv.pdf; Untitled attachment 00083.htm; 3233828 rec.pdf; Untitled 

attachment 00086.htm 

Jeffrey, 
Please confirm t=at I can make payment in the amount of $500. 

Thank you, 

Bella 

Begin forwarded message: 
=br> 

From: " 
Date: March 5, 2014, 3:27:19 AM EST 
To: Bella Klein 

Good morning, Bella 

I've got the official &nbs=;letter from NYFA 

They confirmed the=payment and wrote that I am conditionally applied, now they ask to make 
the=nbsp;deposit pay=ent of $500 as soon as possible in order to reserve the p=ace and to pay the whole price 30 days 
prior to the start of the clas=. 

I attached the invoice and receipt. 

avec soin, 
=ul'sum Osmanova. 

=/html>= 
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