
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Friday, July 1, 2016 1:09 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Gratitude Audit 
Attachments: 201607010903.pdf; Untitled attachment 00066.htm 

attached are confirms that accounting firm needs to send out =o verify bank balances, donation and no outstanding 
litigation page 7 for for leon's office please advise if ok that it is sent to brad thank you 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: =/b>David Hasson 

Subject: =/b>Confirms 

Date: =/b>July 1, 2016 at 9:01:56 AM =DT 

To: =/b>Richard Kahn 

Here you go Rich, 

Thanks 

David M. Hasson CPA, PFS 
Seckendorf =asson & Reilly CPA's, LLC 
3000 Marcus Avenue, Suite 3w4 
Lake =uccess NY 11042 
Phone - 
Fax - 
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