
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Friday, July 1, 2016 10:32 AM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: Fwd: EPSTEIN / Invoice auction 
Attachments: Gladys Nistor image.png; Untitled attachment 00080.htm; 

FactureCOLLINBOCAGE27mai16.pdf; Untitled attachment 00083.htm 

Please advise. I 

Sent from my irthone 

Begin forwarded message: 

Richard Kahn «= 
href=" 

Subject: EPSTEIN Invoice auction 

=div> 

Best regards. 

Marie-Jose h Experton 

From: Bella Klein 
Sent: 30 June 2016 13:36:22 
To: Marie-Joseph Experton 
Subject: Re: EPSTEIN / Invoice auction 

It might be purchase by Baroness Rothschild . If you have no success I w=II ask JE directly 
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Thank you, 

Bella 

On Jun 29, 2016, at 6:09 PM, Marie-Joseph Experton < 
wrote:=br> 

I'll try again tomorrow, but they refused to give me details on the aucti=n by phone, 

Best regards. 

Marie-Joseph Experton 

From: bellaklein < 
Sent: 29 June 2016 20:34:17 
To: Marie-Joseph Experton 
Cc: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Fwd: EPSTEIN / Invoice auction 

Please request a photo of the purchase. Is the attached invoice for pai=ting or shipment 

Thank you, 

Bella 

Begin forwarded message: 
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=non 

Subject: EPSTEIN / I=voice auction 

Date: June 29, 2016 at=1:19:0O PM EDT 

urgent 

PLEASE CONFIRM THAT I CAN PROCEED WITH THE PAYMENT OF THE ATTACHED INVOIEE 
C=RRESPONDING TO A PURCHASE AT AN AUCTION LATE MAY WHICH NEEDS TO BE PAI= IN ORDER TO GET THE 
PAINTING DELIVERED. I HAVE NO OTHER INFORMATION AND CO=LD NOT GET MORE DETAILS BY PHONE. 

Best regards. 

Marie•Joseph Experton 

=/html>= 
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