
From: Richard Kahn < 
Sent: Monday, September 15, 2014 6:58 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Allied Rental 
Attachments: Scan10012.PDF; Untitled attachment 00263.htm 

I was =ble to negotiate 11,416.50 invoice for mini excavator rental to =,000.00 if paid by tomorrow morning please 
advise if ok to =ay thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates =nc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Daphne Wallace < 

Subject: Fwd: STATEMENT OF =CCOUNT 

Date: =/b>September 15, 2014 =t 10:17:48 AM EDT 

To: =/b>Rich Kahn < 

 Forwarded message 
From: =b class="gmail_sendername">Edmundo 2ayas < 
Date: Fri, Aug 29, 2014 at 3:45 PM 
Subject: STATEMENT OF =CCOUNT 
To: Daphne Wallace < 

<=r> 
Good afternoon =aphne, 

Please see attached statement and invoices for =SJ. 

Kindly remit payment at your earliest =onvenience. 
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Thank you. 

Brenda 
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