
From: Richard Joslin 
Sent: Wednesday, April 2, 2014 6:04 PM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: FW: Rothko exchange 
Attachments: Gagosian Rothko.pdf 

Please give me your ph=ne number 

From: Ralph Lerner Imp 
Sent: Friday, March 21, 2014 8:55 AM 
To 
Cc: is ar osin 
Subject: FW: Rothko exchange 

Dear Ji= 

See att=ched Invoice. This was part of an exchange. Apparently the sales ta= on the $2,000,000 was not paid and Leon 
wants to pay it to Gagosian and h=ve Gagosian pay it to NYS. Please confirm if any additional 

Paper w=rk is necessary and notify both me and Leon's finance man , Richard =oslin, as to how it should be done. 

Thanks<=:p> 

Ralph 

&n=sp; 

Ralph E= Lerner 
Art World Advisors 
590 Madison Avenue, 21st=Floor 

ISM 
&n=sp; 

&n=sp; 

From: Richard Joslin < 
Date: Wednesday, March 19, 2014 at 2:52 PM 
To: Ralph Lerner 
Subject: Rothko exchange 
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&n=sp; 

Ralph: 

I need to speak to you=regarding this exchange 

Please email me a time=a time and number to call 

Thanks 

Richard Joslin<=pan style="color:black"> 

CFO 

Elysium Management LLC=/span> 

445 Park Ave 

New York, NY 10022 

From: Richard Joslin 
Sent: Tuesday, January 14, 2014 10:23 AM 
To: ' 
Subject: Pro forma invoice 

=/p> 
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Ralph<=p> 

It was a please meeting =ou last week. I would appreciate if you could forward the invoice fo=m you mentioned. 

Also my contact info is =elow. Note our business name will be changing shortly as will our em=il. 

Many thanks</=pan> 

=/P> 

=/P> 

Richard Joslin 

CFO 

Black Family Office=/o:p> 

445 Park Aveaspan> 

New York, NY 10022<=o:p> 

=/p> 

=/p> 
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