From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Thursday, September 18, 2014 3:23 PM

To: bellaklein

Subject: Re:

yes

On Thu, Sep 18, 2014 at 10:29 AM, bellaklein _:~ wrote:
Jeffrey,

Cost fn- tuition is 7,105 Eu=os. Please confirm i can make payment.

Your Course
85,00
200,00

Total=/h3>
7.105,00 €

Tel:Date: Septem!er 17, 2014 =t 5:05:10 PM EDT

To: Bella Klein < -

Hello Bella, sorry , there were some troubles with=internet yesterday.

The forms should be filled on the website=www.lsi.edu <http://www.lsi.edu/>
firstly you should fill it on the left, and then is my personal inform=tion.

| made a snapshots of the screen with everything how it=should look like.

If there any questions, please ask me
=br=thank you

avec soin,
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p=ease note

The information contained in this communication is
co=fidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside inf=rmation, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the p=operty of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
com=unication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawfu=. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us im=ediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation=gmail.com> , and
destroy thi= communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyr=ght -all rights reserved
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