From: Ann Rodriquez <

Sent: Tuesday, February 24, 2015 T:46 PM

To: jeffrey E.

Cc: Daphne Wallace; Rich Kahn

Subject: Stripping Machine & Reflective Coating

Attachments: Inv_135406_from_US_SPECIALTY_COATINGS_5544.pdf; Untitled attachment 00025.htm
Purchased.

Sent from m= iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

trom:“Larry” [
Date: February=24, 2015 at 3:06:47 PM AST
To: — >

Subject: Invoice fro= US SPECIALTY COATINGS.

Dear Ann,
Your invoice is attached and was paid by credit card=

US SPECIALTY COATINGS
100= McFarland, 400 Blvd.
Alpharetta, GA 30004

=/span=

Feel free to call Tel #: _f you have any que=tions.

Thank you for your business - we ap=reciate it very much.

Visit our website www. usspecialtycoatings.com <http://www.usspecialtycoatings.com> =to view all our

products
and our new ones that we continuo=sly upgrade.

Sincerely,
</=pan>

Larri E. Fitziatrick Senior Account Manaier
L)

1000 McFarland 400 Blvd. Alph=retta GA 30004
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www.=sscproducts.com <http://www.usscproducts.com=
www.usspecialtycoatings.com <http://www.usspecialtycoati=gs.com>

We=manufacture the world's highest quality Athletic Field Paints, Athletic
Equipment and Custom Stencils at the best prices to help the cl=ents stay
within their budgets while not having to experien=e less than or just
standard quality products that do not I=st. No one has brighter, longer
lasting paints than U.S. Sp=cialty Coatings.
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