
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Wednesday, December 10, 2014 5:36 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Accounting Invoice - Oct 2014 
Attachments: 20141209132119095.pdf; Untitled attachment 00128.htm; 20141209132113587.pdf; 

Untitled attachment 00131.htm 

attached are accounting fees for october =014 

oct 2014 $14,125 =nbsp; 
as compared to oct 2013 (with marks paneth) =39,900 

please advise if ok to pay from =TC 
thank =ou 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates =nc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
to 
fa 
ce 

Begin forwarded message: 

-, lFrom: David Hasson 

Subject: Revised =ills 

Date: =/b>December 9, 2014 at =:50:08 PM EST 

To: =/b>'Richard Kahn' = 

Hi =ich, 

Here are the revised bills. 
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Can we =alk about the info I need? 

I am =eaving my office at 3:30 today. 

0 

David M. =asson CPA, PFS 

Seckendorf Hasson =amp; Reilly CPA's, LLC 

3000 Marcus =venue, Suite 3w4 

Lake Success NY =1042 
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