
From: Ann Rodriquez < 
Sent: Friday, June 19, 2015 7:21 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Fwd: STAFF LOCKER Estimate from AMERICAN EXPORT 
Attachments: Est_R1506185_from_AMERICAN_EXPORT_CO.INC.3336.pdf; Untitled attachment 

00375.htm 

Do I have your approval for the loc=ers in the amount of $4,771.20? 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Ann Rodriquez < <mailto 
Date: June 18, 2015 at 3:33:28 PM A=T 
To: Rich Kahn < <mailto 
Cc: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Subject: <=>Fwd: STAFF LOCKER Estimate from AMERICAN EXPORT 

Cc: "an= rodriquez" < <mailtol 
Subject: STAFF LOCKER Estimate from AMERICAN EXPO=T 

Ann, 

> > 

Please review the a=tached estimate. Feel free to contact us if you have 
=ny questions. 

We look forward to working w=th you. 

Sincerely, 
=br> 
Jack Ryan 
American Export Company=/span> 
jryan@am=ricanexportcompany.com <mailto 
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