
From: Ann Rodriquez 
Sent: Monday, September 14, 2015 7:07 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Big N: Caribbean Battery 
Attachments: INV. 88655 - Caribbean Battery - 8 HD31 batteries - Big N.pdf; Untitled attachment 

00250.htm 

Hey Bossman, 

Caribbean battery delivered 8 batteries to be used for the Launch of Big N=but my credit card was declined. 

Do I have y=ur permission to use your LS.I Credit Card to pay for the batteries? 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 

Begin forwarded mes=age: 

From: Daphne Wallac= Date: September 14, 2015 at 
2:42:28 PM AST 

To: ann rodriq=e gt; 
Subject: Caribbean Battery - September 14, 2015 

<=iv direltr">Big N needed 8 new batteries to get her ready for launch. 

Caribbean Battery already delivered them. Need paymen= today. $1,600. 

Invoice attached, DW</=iv> 
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