
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, July 2, 2015 6:29 PM 
To: Ivjet 
Subject: Fwd: ZDC Great Room Stereo 

 Forwarded messag= 
From: Brice Gordon 
Date: Thu, Jul 2, 2015 at 8:00 PM 
Subject: Re: ZDC Great=Room Stereo 
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacatio=@gmail.com» 
Cc: Rich Kahn 
&=t; 

Jeffrey 
As requested attached opti=ns and links for new Amps for Great Room 
How would you like to proceed=C2* 
Regards Brice 

On Fri, Jun 26, 2015 at 7:07 PM, jeffrey E. <jee=acation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

=div dir="ltr">get differnt amps those are not good 
=div class="gmail_extra"> 

On Fri, Jun 26, 2=15 at 9:03 PM, Zorro Ranch < M > > wrote: 
=blockquote class="gmail_quote" style="margin:0 0 0 .8ex;border-left:lp= #ccc solid;padding-left:lex"> 
New, ok-- but? 

On Jun 26, 2015, at 7:00 PM, jeffrey E. =Itjeevacation@=mail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» wrote: 

New di=ferent but 

On Friday, June 26, 2015, Brice Gordo= wrote: 

Jeffrey 

Ref: Great Ro=m Stereo System 
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Attached: 
Photo of existing equipment for your reference 
E Mail traffic for Shawn Mills, Listen Up•AB= 
Crown Amp PDF 

As requested the Movie R= front left and right Klispch speakers have been moved to the Great 
Rm. 

Long story short, the sound quality is ter=ible. 

Situation: 
Blown Tweeters =n Klispch Speakers, these have been ordered with new sub for Movie Rm 
Volume control pots on 3 x Crown Amps have b=come unstable. 

Recommendations: 
=ave control pots cleaned at a estimated cost of $600.00, other parts maybe=needed $200 plus. 

please note attached E Mail, "there maybe other pro=lems" 
30 day turn around 
or 

Replace all=3 Amps at an estimated cost of $6,900.00 plus labor. 

Notes: 
Existing Amps are discontinued so part availabi=ity could be tricky 
Amps have never bee= work on or serviced in my time. 

How do you wish =o proceed. fix or new? 

regards 

Brice Gordon 
Stanley, =M 

=C24, please note 

The information contained in this communic=tion is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constit=te inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addresse=. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying =f this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and =ay be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, pleas= notify us immediately by 
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return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, andar>destroy this communication and all copies 
thereof, 

including all attarhments. copyright -all rights reserved 

=/div>--

•=AO please note 

The information contained in this communication is<=r>confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute insid= information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is =he property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of thiscommunication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be un=awful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify =s immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevac=tion@gmail.com> , and 
destro= this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. =opyright -all rights reserved 

Brice Gordon 
Stanley, NM=C2* 

Ph: (505) 934 2809 <tel:%28505%29%20934%2028=9> 
=/div> 

please note 

=he information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be =ttorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is in=ended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEEU nauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any p=rt thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have rece=ved this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
ret=rn e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
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destroy this communication an= all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights r=served 
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