
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Sunday, October 18, 2015 10:34 AM 
To: Ann Rodriquez 
Subject: Re: Omar 

pay him total after he finishes couch back 

=div class="gmail_extra"> 

On Sat, Oct 17, 2=15 at 9:29 PM, Ann Rodriquez < <mailto 
=rote: 

Good night =ossman, 

> > 

Do I have your permission =o pay Omar his final payment ($3,280.00) for work done at the Main Compoun= and 
the Helipad? 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 

On Oct 7, 2015, at 12:08 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.co=> wrote: 

$3,280.00)? 

yes 

O= Wed, Oct 7, 2015 at 12:06 PM, Ann Rodriquez < 

Good afternoon Bos=man, 

/a» wrote: 

Omar is requesting 50% payment from both projects Heli wall and MC wall (re=uested amount 

Total amount for both projects: $6,560.00 
Heli wall $2,560.00 -outstanding 
MC wall $4,000.00 -outstanding 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 
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please note 

The inf=rmation contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorne=-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended =nly for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unaut=orized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part the=eof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received th=s 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-m=il or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmailcom <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all co=ies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserveck=r> 

=C2 please note 

The information contained in this co=munication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may c=nstitute inside 
information, and is intended only for the use of the ad=ressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, disclosure or 
co=ying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibitedand may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error,=please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com<k>, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, including =11 attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

2 

EFTA_R1_02 151029 
EFTA02716081


