From: eric roth <

Sent: Tuesday, March 31, 2015 7:53 PM

To: jeffrey E.

Subject: FW: Qutstanding Invoices

Attachments: JEGE,LLC Invoice.pdf; #13127 Final INvoice Oct 14 pdf

ERIC H. ROTH | PRESIDENT
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<http://www.intljet.com/> <http://twitter.com/#!/intljet> <http://www.facebook.com/intljet>

2221 S=ithtown Avenue, Long Island MacArthur Airport, Ronkonkoma, New York 11779<=:p>

From: Eric Roth

Sent: Thursday, February 05, 2015 2:08 PM
To: 'jeffrey E.'

Ce: _ Eileen Craig

Subject: Outstanding Invoices

Good afternoon Jeffrey,

The two (2) invoices attached are very overdue and | =ould appreciate if you would satisfy them so that | can clear them
from my=receivables.

EFTA_R1_02151063
EFTA02716089



Aside from not charging for many of the smaller=;requests”, | have provided a significant discount for the entertainment
system, just trying to re=ch towards breakeven - at best.

I am a small company, so your prompt remittance will =ertainly help my cash flow position.

Please call me should you have any questions, but tru=t me when | say that | was more than fair and generous.<=p>

Thank you,

Warm regards,

Eric

ERIC H. ROTH | PRESIDENT

P</=pan> 631.737.5900 | C~/ NN | I oilto: I > | «vw.intjet.=om

<http://www.intljet.com/> <http://twitter.com/#!/intljet> =/span> <http://www.facebook.com/intljet> =/span>

2221 S=ithtown Avenue, Long Island MacArthur Airport, Ronkonkoma, New York 11779<=:p>

EFTA_R1_02151064
EFTA02716090



