
From: 
Sent: Wednesday, March 12, 2014 7:10 PM 
To: Joshua Schmell; Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: Fw: NRF Invoices - Siegal - Estate Administration 
Attachments: Scan001.pdf 

Is this a joke. Josh can you call about getting paid for acomplishing NOTHING. 
Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 

From: "Schaer, Bryan" 
Date: Wed, 12 Mar 2014 18:52:43 +0000 
To: 
Cc: Michaels, Philip J.  ?; Jeffrey Epstein<jeevacation@gmail.com>; Joshua 
Schmell 
Subject: RE: NRF Invoices - Siegal - Estate Administration 

Thank you for your e-mail. I have passed this along to Phil. In the interim, can you please facilitate payment of our 
invoices? 

Regards, 

Bryan 

Bryan Schaer I Collections Manager 

Fulbright & Jaworski LLP 

NORTON ROSE FULBRIGHT 

Law around the world 

EFTA_R1_02159447 

EFTA02717011



nortonrosefulbright.com chttp://nortonrosefulbright.com/> 

We are pleased to announce the establishment of our global regulation and investigations group 
<http://www.nortonrosefulbright.com/our-services/regulation-and-investigationsk — providing global connectivity 
across jurisdictions, industry sectors and regulatory fronts. 

From 
Sent: We. nes. ay, Marc 12, 2014 1:24 PM 
To: Schaer, Bryan 
Cc: Michaels, Philip J.; Jeffrey Epstein; Joshua Schmell 
Subject: Re: NRF Invoices - Siegal - Estate Administration 

Please advise what the lastest news is. We have been chasing Phil for three years for information only he can get. Thank 
you. Peggy Siegal 

Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 

From: "Schaer, Bryan" 

Date: Wed, 12 Mar 2014 16:48:43 +0000 

To: 'Peggy Siegal 

Cc: Michaels, Philip J 

Subject: NRF Invoices - Siegal - Estate Administration 

Dear Ms. Siegal, 

I work with Phil Michaels in the Business group in the NRF-New York office. Our records indicate the following invoices 
on the above remain outstanding: 

Inv Number 
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Inv Date 

Inv Amt Billed 

Balance Due 

11399168 

09/30/2013 

$ 2,146.16 

$ 2,146.16 

11405774 

10/28/2013 

$ 1,999.00 

$ 1,999.00 

11425323 

01/31/2014 

$ 3,048.00 

$ 3,048.00 

11431730 

02/26/2014 

$ 1,195.00 

$ 1,195.00 

For your reference, the attached file contains a copy of each invoice in the order listed above. Upon your review, can 
you please assist us in processing payment for these invoices. 

Please feel free to contact me with any questions. 

Many thanks, 

Bryan 
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Bryan Schaer I Collections Manager 

Fulbright & Jaworski LLP 

NORTON ROSE FULBRIGHT 

Law around the world 

nortonrosefulbright.com <http://nortonrosefulbright.comh 

We are pleased to announce the establishment of our global regulation and investigations group 
<http://www.nortonrosefulbright.com/our-services/regulation-and-investigationsk — providing global connectivity 
across jurisdictions, industry sectors and regulatory fronts. 

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email, including any attachments, is confidential and may be privileged. If you are not 
the intended recipient please notify the sender immediately, and please delete it; you should not copy it or use it for any 
purpose or disclose its contents to any other person. Norton Rose Fulbright entities reserve the right to monitor all email 
communications through their networks. 

Norton Rose Fulbright Australia, Norton Rose Fulbright LLP, Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP, Norton Rose Fulbright 
South Africa (incorporated as Deneys Reitz Inc) and Fulbright & Jaworski LLP, each of which is a separate legal entity, are 
members of Norton Rose Fulbright Verein, a Swiss Verein. Details of each entity, with certain regulatory information, are 
at nortonrosefulbright.com. Norton Rose Fulbright Verein helps coordinate the activities of the members but does not 
itself provide legal services to clients. 
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