
From: Richard Kahn < 
Sent: Wednesday, April 15, 2015 9:07 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Fwd: Invoice N9081E- WO 3801 
Attachments: image001.png; Untitled attachment 00031.htm; invoice #15-483, N9081E.pdf; Untitled 

attachment 00034.htm 

please advise if ok to pay attached invoice for 27,824 thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: =/b>Larry 

Subject: =/b>Fwd: Invoice =908JE- WO 3801 

Date: April 10, 2015 at 2:42:42 PM EDT 

To: =/b>Rich Kahn Bella Klein < 

Approved 
JEGE =nc 
Maintenace items,. 
Boca =ircraft accept amx, but charge 3.5%,. Seamed to much for additional =harge,. Check via mail is fine, no 

rush 

The high dollar item $25,000 was TCAS =ystem AD Mandatory upgrade,. 
TCAS is Traffic =ollision Avoidance System,. Keeps aircraft From midair collisions =. 
Important item,. 
Thx,. 
Larry 

Sent =rom my iPad 

EFTA_R1_02165882 
EFTA02717828



Begin forwarded =essage: 

=uestions. 

From: Amber Barko 
Date: April 10, 2015 at 1:32:20 PM EDT 
To: 
Cc: =ike Robinson < 
Subject: Invoice N9081E- WO 3801 

Good afternoon =arry, 

Please find attached =our invoice for N9081E for work order 3801. Let us know if you have any 

Thank you very =uch, 

Amber Barko 
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